

Bidder:	TCRC			Bravo Services			VSI		
Date/Time Received	03/12/20 1:05pm			03/13/20 7:30am			03/13/20 9:50am		
Received Addendum	Yes			Yes			Yes		
	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3
Justice Center	No bid.	No bid.	No bid.	\$1,600.00/mo. \$19,200.00/yr.	\$1,680.00/mo. \$20,160.00/yr.	\$1,720.00/mo. \$20,640.00/yr.	\$5,617.00/mo. \$67,404.00/yr.	\$5,950.00/mo. \$71,400.00/yr.	\$6,430.00/mo. \$77,160.00/yr.
Courthouse	No bid.	No bid.	No bid.	\$1,800.00/mo. \$21,600.00/yr.	\$1,890.00/mo. \$22,680.00/yr.	\$1,950.00/mo. \$23,400.00/yr.	\$3,915.00/mo. \$46,980.00/yr.	\$4,310.00/mo. \$51,720.00/yr.	\$4,645.00/mo. \$55,740.00/yr.
Old Post Office	\$1,583.33/mo. \$19,000.00/yr.	\$1,708.33/mo. \$20,500.00/yr.	\$1,833.33/mo. \$22,000.00/yr.	\$1,100.00/mo. \$13,200.00/yr.	\$1,150.00/mo. \$13,800.00/yr.	\$1,175.00/mo. \$14,100.00/yr.	\$1,240.00/mo. \$14,880.00/yr.	\$1,341.00/mo. \$16,092.00/yr.	\$1,444.00/mo. \$17,328.00/yr.
Tazewell Building	\$766.67/mo. \$9,200.00/yr.	\$850.00/mo. \$10,200.00/yr.	\$933.33/mo. \$11,200.00/yr.	\$1,100.00/mo. \$13,200.00/yr.	\$1,150.00/mo. \$13,800.00/yr.	\$1,175.00/mo. \$14,100.00/yr.	\$850.00/mo. \$10,200.00/yr.	\$929.00/mo. \$11,148.00/yr.	\$996.00/mo. \$11,952.00/yr.
McKenzie Building	\$1,916.67/mo. \$23,000.00/yr.	\$2,083.33/mo. \$25,000.00/yr.	\$2,250.00/mo. \$27,000.00/yr.	\$850.00/mo. \$10,200.00/yr.	\$875.00/mo. \$10,500.00/yr.	\$900.00/mo. \$10,800.00/yr.	\$1,625.00/mo. \$19,500.00/yr.	\$1,789.00/mo. \$21,468.00/yr.	\$1,920.00/mo. \$23,040.00/yr.
Arcade Building (includes VA)	\$766.67/mo. \$9,200.00/yr.	\$850.00/mo. \$10,200.00/yr.	\$933.33/mo. \$11,200.00/yr.	\$750.00/mo. \$9,000.00/yr.	\$780.00/mo. \$9,360.00/yr.	\$820.00/mo. \$9,840.00/yr.	\$461.00/mo. \$5,532.00/yr.	\$502.00/mo. \$6,024.00/yr.	\$535.00/mo. \$6,420.00/yr.
EMA Building	\$375.00/mo. \$4,500.00/yr.	\$391.67/mo. \$4,700.00/yr.	\$408.33/mo. \$4,900.00/yr.	\$650.00/mo. \$7,800.00/yr.	\$675.00/mo. \$8,100.00/yr.	\$700.00/mo. \$8,400.00/yr.	\$461.00/mo. \$5,532.00/yr.	\$502.00/mo. \$6,024.00/yr.	\$535.00/mo. \$6,420.00/yr.
Day Porter	No bid.	No bid.	No bid.	\$2,750.00/mo. \$33,000.00/yr.	\$2,800.00/mo. \$33,600.00/yr.	\$2,850.00/mo. \$34,200.00/yr.	\$3,200.00/mo. \$38,400.00/yr.	\$3,442.00/mo. \$41,304.00/yr.	\$3,682.00/mo. \$44,184.00/yr.